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Abstract: 
 
Financial literacy is an essential skill that has power over an individual's decision-making, 
long-term economic stability, and national economic health. This paper explores financial 
literacy trends specifically in the United States, with a focus on the period following the 2008 
financial crisis till our present day. It investigates how widespread knowledge gaps have relation 
to negative behaviors resulting in debt, savings, and investment, particularly among young 
adults, minorities, and low-income households. The study uses state-level mandates on 
financial education and analyzes their effectiveness in improving economic outcomes. Drawing 
on data from national surveys and peer-reviewed research, the paper highlights both the 
progress made and the challenges that remain in the path ahead. It concludes with policy 
recommendations targeted towards expanding access to financial education and fostering 
greater financial equity all throughout the United States. 
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1.​ Introduction 

The people of the United States were faced with the worst financial crisis since the Great 
Depression about two decades ago, in 2008. This crisis, the product of risky financial making by 
institutions and individuals, led to millions of Americans losing their homes, savings, and jobs, 
making their everyday lives all the more difficult. While it is commonly known that this crisis 
could primarily be attributed to the failures of our essential financial regulatory systems, a less 
obvious factor also played a role in the irresponsible choices made by the public, an extensive 
lack of financial literacy. The knowledge of adjustable-rate mortgages, risks of taking on 
high-interest debt, and how to examine financial risk was not common among many Americans. 
While this crisis had many devastating effects, a positive can be seen, as it served as a signal 
for how dangerous being financially illiterate can be, not just on the scale of individuals but even 
with the economy as a whole. 

Financial literacy means having the capability to comprehend and accurately be able to organize 
your personal finances through various skillsets such as budgeting, saving, investing, debt 
management, and many more skills. Having knowledge of these tasks is more crucial in today's 
global landscape than ever before.  

With every passing day the financial world becomes increasingly difficult to navigate with 
obstacles such as stagnant wages and rising student loan debt. This climate leaves individuals 
incredibly vulnerable to making poor financial decisions that may follow them for the rest of their 
lives. When given questions regarding basic financial concepts such as interest rates, inflation, 
or risk diversification, surveys from the National Financial Capability Study(NFCS) and the 
Federal Reserve reveal that the majority of adults are unable to answer such questions 
accurately. 

This apparent shortage in knowledge of the financial realm represents more than personal and 
individual challenges, it proves to be a pressing societal problem that has vastly spread 
implications in the economic and social states of our world. A lack of financial literacy is 
associated with higher levels of debt, insufficient retirement funds, and a sense of financial 
insecurity. Taking a look at a broader macroeconomic scale, these obstacles on the individual 
levels actually add to the widening wealth gaps and decreased economic resiliency during 
periods of crisis such as economic recessions. 

This paper aims to address the research question: Why is financial literacy so critical for 
individuals and society, to what extent is financial illiteracy a problem in the United States, and 
what strategies can effectively improve it? Through the examination of trends in financial literacy 
rates, specifically from 2008 to the present day, and breaking down the impact of educational 
initiatives and policy implementations, this study will focus on both the significance of financial 
literacy and the potential opportunities to create a more financially capable population. 

2.​ Literature Review 

Financial literacy, commonly defined as the ability to understand and apply financial concepts, is 
widely accepted as a form of human capital that allows for positive economic decision-making 
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(Lusardi & Mitchell). The NFCS reports that approximately only one-third of adult Americans can 
correctly answer basic financial literacy questions on fundamentals like compound interest, 
inflation, and risk diversification. This blatant lack of knowledge is more than a theoretical point 
of concern. A causal link can be seen between households with lower financial literacy rates 
tend to also be carrying higher debt and have much greater interest costs, and thus are stuck in 
a loop unable to build emergency savings (Lusardi & Tufano). A prime example being how 
individuals who are classified as less financially literate have been found to end up paying more 
in loan and mortgage fees. 

The existing literature this paper will utilize also highlights significant gaps in wealth equity which 
parallels in financial literacy trends. Education is a privilege and a commodity that is not always 
guaranteed to all Americans. Gaps in wealth can often also mean gaps in knowledge and due to 
systemic societal disparities minority groups can often be disadvantaged. According to FINRA, 
more than 50% of Black Americans have credit scores lower than 640 which means that they 
are effectively being excluded from beneficial credit opportunities. In a similar manner gender 
disparities are equally concerning. Worldwide women consistently have lower scores than men 
on standardized financial literacy assessments, even after controlling for confounding variables 
such as income and education. Low-income and minority households are consistently excluded 
from mainstream financial services. This causes them to turn to higher cost alternatives which 
clearly displays a structural issue closely connected to financial illiteracy. 

Many scholars and researchers have also previously examined solutions aiming to improve 
financial literacy outcomes. Many scholars showed that adding personal-finance coursework to 
school curriculum greatly enhanced students knowledge and behavior compared to students in 
other states without mandates (Lusardi and Mitchell). However, it is important to note that critics 
warn that education solely cannot entirely solve deep systemic issues (Lang). There is a need 
for direct  regulation and for financial tools to become more accessible. Moreover, the recent 
causal analysis of NFCS data presents statistically significant improvements in financial status 
following educational initiatives. 

In summary, existing  literature holds three common points. Firstly, that financial literacy holds a 
significant link to decision-making and economic outcomes. Second, large disparities in wealth 
persist across minority demographic groups. Lastly, while education is key, it must be combined 
with structural reforms in schooling and legislation to fully address gaps in literacy and inclusion 
on a broad scale. 

3.​ Methodology 

This study employs an approach with multiple methods, integrating quantitative analysis of 
existing data and a qualitative review of educational policies. The primary data sources that will 
be utilized are the NFCS waves (2009–2024), which contain survey data for over 25,000 U.S. 
adults every three years on knowledge, attitudes, and behaviors related to personal finance. 
The study also integrates data from the Federal Reserve and FINRA on household savings, 
debt levels, and the levels of emergency funds, thus supplementing the NFCS with objective 
socioeconomic measures. 
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The quantitative analysis aspect has two main components. First, this study will examine trends 
in financial literacy rates and other related behaviors such as emergency saving, debt 
management, and being able to make monthly ends meet, from the years 2009 to 2024. A focus 
will be placed on shifts occurring after major events like the 2008 financial crisis, the COVID-19 
pandemic, and regulatory reforms, an example being the 2010 Dodd-Frank legislation 
(McMillion). Secondly, this paper will take a closer look at the correlations between literacy 
levels and real world applications of financial literacy concepts like debt-to-income ratios, credit 
accessibility, and retirement preparedness. Regression models will be used to quantify the 
actual strength of the relationships between these factors. 

The qualitative aspect of this study is exploring a state-level case study of mandated financial 
education policies. Three states: Georgia, Texas, and Virginia - were selected for in-depth 
review due to their differing approaches to personal finance requirements in high schools 
(Brown et al.). An analysis will be made of how each state’s mandate was implemented, what 
curriculum standards were integrated, and how results changed post-implementation. Reports, 
academic evaluations, and relevant state-level NFCS data will inform the analysis. 

This multifaceted methodology works to answer three core questions: how financial literacy has 
evolved in the recent global landscape, how it relates to economic stability at the household 
level, and what mechanisms prove to be successful in enacting change. Ultimately, this paper 
provides evidence-based recommendations for policymakers, educators, and financial 
institutions to be able to improve the financial capability of citizens across the U.S. 

4.​ Analysis & Findings 

The need for financial literacy has become more prominent in public discourse, academic 
inquiry, and policy debates, especially in a post 2008 financial crisis world. The crisis itself acted 
as an ominous reminder of how a lack of financial knowledge among the general public can 
contribute to systemic economic inequality. In the years afterward, multiple studies began 
examining specifically how Americans interacted with basic financial concepts, ultimately 
bringing light to both the scope of the problem and some promising opportunities. 

One of the most widely cited sources, the FINRA Investor Education Foundation's National 
Financial Capability Study (NFCS), has been conducted every three years since the year 2009. 
The survey clearly displays consistently low financial literacy scores among U.S. adults, with 
only around 34% correctly answering four or more out of five basic financial questions in the 
most recent study. This shows there has been very little improvement since 2009 and we are 
nowhere near an acceptable level, clearly suggesting that large segments of the population still 
lack core financial skills (Frees et al.). 

Taking a closer look at this data actually reveals even deeper inequalities. Young adults aged 
18–34 consistently score worse on tests with these concepts in comparison with older groups. 
Minority groups, specifically Black and Hispanic Americans, tend to obtain lower scores on 
these tests even when the study controls for factors like income and education (Shanbhag). This 
implies that the issue is greater than individual responsibility, it spans to systematic inequities 
disfavoring minority groups. 
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State-level mandates on personal finance education offer one of the clearest lenses through 
which to evaluate interventions. Research by Urban, Schmeiser, and Collins found that students 
who received financial education as a high school graduation requirement were significantly 
more likely to display sound financial behaviors in young adulthood, such as budgeting, saving, 
and avoiding high-interest credit products (Urban, Schmeiser, and Collins). More recent studies, 
like those conducted by the Council for Economic Education (CEE), show that as of 2024, 25 
states have implemented personal finance requirements at the high school level, with positive 
correlations emerging between these mandates and improved credit scores, higher savings 
rates, and lower default rates among young adults. 

For example, the U.S. states of Georgia, Texas, and Idaho implemented personal finance 
curricula in schools between 2000 and 2010. A paper published by the Federal Reserve found 
that the students in these states partaking in these lessons were significantly more likely to 
apply for low-interest student loans and had significantly lower rates of credit card inadequacy 
by the time they had reached their mid-20s. These findings provide clear evidence supporting 
the idea that formal education initiatives on the topic can lead to long-term behavioral 
improvements. 

The economic impacts related to financial literacy are not solely tied to individuals. On the larger 
macroeconomic level, widespread financial literacy, like the state seen in America, actually has 
the potential to allow space for economic decline as consumers will have reduced agency and 
default rates would be on the rise. A report by the Global Financial Literacy Excellence Center 
(GFLEC) discusses how financially illiterate individuals are less likely to invest in the stock 
market, less likely to participate in employer-sponsored retirement plans, and more likely to 
accumulate high-cost debt, allowing them to stay in a cycle of generational debt rather than 
wealth. These behaviors, when scaled up across millions, can create a decline on the overall 
economic wellness of our country and deepen wealth inequality between the classes. 

5.​ Discussion & Impact Analysis 

A lack of financial literacy has broader impacts than hardship for the individual. When a 
significant portion of the public lacks the knowledge or tools to make informed financial 
decisions, the effects are seen rippling through communities, labor markets, and even all the 
way up to national economies. The most severely impacted are arguably the young adults that 
are just joining the workforce and the professional landscape, low-income households that are 
living paycheck to paycheck, and minority communities that have historically been underserved 
by mainstream financial institutions due to discriminatory rhetoric. 

The consequences are drastic. We face higher rates of bankruptcy, chronic debt cycles, 
underutilization of retirement savings plans, and just overall greater financial insecurity. 
Although, all hope isn’t lost. Research consistently displays that even minimal gains in financial 
knowledge can lead to marked improvements in behavior, such as saving more, borrowing less, 
and making plans for potential financial emergencies (Levine & Gale). Increasing literacy is not 
just a matter of establishing equity, but one that can ensure long-term economic resilience for 
our nation. It can promote upward mobility and help close systemic wealth gaps. 

6.​ Conclusion 
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This research has revealed that the financial literacy gap in the U.S. remains an issue that is 
persistent and proves to have a deeply negative effect on the livelihoods of American citizens. 
Post the 2008 financial crisis, public awareness has increased in the topic of financial literacy, 
and state-level mandates have been successful in bringing some encouraging results. Even so, 
data on financial performance and knowledge of financial topics clearly show that financial 
literacy remains uneven across demographic groups and that changes within our infrastructure 
are still necessary. 

In order to improve financial literacy across the nation, policymakers should make personal 
finance education a required part of curricula across all states, beginning as early as the 
formative years of middle school. Schools should integrate financial topics into STEM and social 
studies curricula to promote interdisciplinary thinking and encourage thinking of financial literacy 
as a baseline. Financial institutions must also provide transparent communication and 
community outreach, potentially leading initiatives of their own in order to make sure the public 
is informed in case of a potential market crash. Lastly, federal agencies should invest in 
long-term evaluation of their procedures in order to determine which strategies yield the greatest 
returns. Only through combined and cohesive efforts across education, legal, and private 
sectors can financial literacy be significantly improved. 
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